
West Orange Public Schools
West Orange, New Jersey 07052

BID SUMMARY AND CONTRACT AWARD RECOMMENDATION

On authorization of the Business Administrator, formal bids were solicited for Electrical
Upgrades @ Gregory ES, Hazel ES, Mt. Pleasant ES, and Redwood ES, Bid #24-07. This
solicitation was made by an advertised Public Notice appearing in the Newark Star Ledger on
July 17, 2024.

Bids were sent to the following vendors:

ALI ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR
Astro Electrical Contractor LLC
BOZ Electric
ConstructConnect
DEE-EN Electrical Contracting, Inc.
Dobco Inc
Dodge Data & Analytics
Generations Services Inc
Hertz Electric LLC
Kane Communications
Manor II Electric Inc.
POWER WITH PRESTIGE INC
Sal Electric Co., Inc
TSUJ Corp.
Vanore Electric Inc
VPV ELECTRIC INC

Sealed bids were opened and read aloud on Tuesday, August 20, 2024 at 11:00 AM at the
Administration Building, Room 203, 179 Eagle Rock Avenue, West Orange, NJ 07052.

Those in attendance were:

Name Firm
Michael Cimmino WOBOE
Nick Munoz WOBOE
Tonya Flowers WOBOE
Trenae Lambkin WOBOE
Vincent Obedoza DiCara Rubino Architects
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Proposals were received from the following companies:

Bidder CONTRACT A CONTRACT B CONTRACT C CONTRACT D CONTRACT E CONTRACT F

ALI ELECTRICAL
CONTRACTOR

$ 670,000.00 $ 710,000.00 $ 721,000.00 $ 912,000.00 $ 1,380,000.00 $ 1,633,000.00

BOZ Electric $ 706,800.00 $ 773,800.00 $ 677,000.00 $ 873,000.00 $ 1,480,600.00 $ 1,550,000.00

DEE-EN Electrical
Contracting, Inc.

$ 842,000.00 $ 1,005,000.00 $ 825,000.00 No Bid $ 1,840,000.00 No Bid

Manor II Electric
Inc.

$ 566,000.00 $ 650,000.00 $ 563,000.00 $ 787,000.00 $ 1,216,000.00 $ 1,350,000.00

POWERWITH
PRESTIGE INC

$ 608,000.00 $ 728,000.00 $ 528,000.00 $ 736,000.00 $ 1,336,000.00 $ 1,264,000.00

Sal Electric Co., Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Info $ 1,750,832.00

Sal Electric Co., Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1,445,000.00 No Info

TSUJ Corp. $ 487,147.00 $ 538,757.00 $ 441,707.00 $ 588,773.00 $ 1,025,904.00 $ 1,030,480.00

Vanore Electric Inc $ 860,465.00 $ 881,757.00 $ 682,253.00 $ 1,107,000.00 $ 1,743,000.00 $ 1,789,000.00

VPV ELECTRIC
INC

$ 625,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1,390,000.00

Allowance for Unforeseen conditions is included into the Base Bid. Any unused amount will be
returned back to the District at the end of the project:

Allowances

Contract A Contract B Contract C Contract D Contract E Contract F

$ 130,000.00 $ 130,000.00 $ 60,000.00 $ 60,000.00 $ 260,000.00 $ 120,000.00

A review for material defects in the Bid Documents of the lowest bids was performed by Cleary
Giacobbe Alfieri Jacobs, LLC the Board’s legal counsel.

Based on the above, recommendation for the award of Contract E: Single Overall Contract -
All Project Work for (Contract ‘A & B’) Electrical Upgrades at Gregory Elementary School
& Hazel Elementary School to TSUJ Corp. in the amount of $1,025,904.00.

Based on the above, recommendation for the award Contract F: Single Overall Contract -
All Project Work for (Contract ‘C & D’) Electrical Upgrades at Mt. Pleasant Elementary
School & Redwood Elementary School to TSUJ Corp. in the amount of $1,030,480.00

Board Approved: September 16, 2024


